
Last Will and Testament Sizes
Last will and testaments are legal and notarized documents that clients or testators use in
planning the distribution of their assets and properties, with the help of a lawyer or attorney.
The format is necessary to produce a comprehensive and binding will that an executor can
implement following the standardized sizes.

Last Will and Testament Sizes Standard

Letter (8.5 x 11)

The standard US Letter size paper follows the American National Standards Institute (ANSI)
for paper sizes, adopting the ANSI Y14.1 standard. The US Letter size has dimensions of
8.5 x 11 inches, with the format almost identical to the ISO A4 format, functioning similarly in
producing business and educational documents, like last will and testament, blank forms,
cover letters, or consumer pamphlets.



Legal (8.5 x 14)

The Legal size paper has a measurement of 8.5 x 14 inches that many businesses,
agencies, and institutions use for printing legal documents, including last will and testament,
for court use, as many lawyers and attorneys recommend the paper size for clients.
Businesses also utilize the Legal size paper for different purposes aside from legal
documents by generating it as a brochure, leaflet, flyer, or price list.

A4 (8.3 x 11.7)

The A4 standard size paper has measurements of 8.3 x 11.7 inches, following the
standards set by the International Organization for Standardization under ISO 216. The A
series paper is the most common variation, with the A4 size recognized as the classic paper
size for printers that many individuals and organizations use for standard documents. These
include kit worksheets, deeds, one-page summaries, and final papers that can fit the
average envelope size for delivering classified documents.



Last Will and Testament Sizes for Print

When printing last will and testament documents, individuals can select from the two
standard sizes, following the US Letter size of 8.5 x 11 inches, Legal size of 8.5 x 14 inches,
and A4 size of 8.3 x 11.7 inches, for business and legal purposes. Use durable and
high-quality paper when printing the last will and testament, considering the font size and
style to ensure that the text is readable and understandable.



Last Will and Testament Sizes for Microsoft Word

Managing the last will and testament size in Microsoft Word is much easier considering that
this word processor is user-friendly, creating the document effortlessly and incorporating all
the necessary elements of the will, developing the record on an appropriate paper size for
distribution and legality. Individuals can choose to produce the last will and testament in a
US Letter, Legal, or A4 size for standardized sizes or the tabloid, executive, envelope, A3,
etc.



Last Will and Testament Sizes for Apple Pages

Mac users can utilize Apple Pages on their branded Mac devices to develop last will and
testament documents on various paper sizes, including the US Letter size measuring 8.5 x
11 inches or the A4 size of 8.3 x 11.7 inches that individuals write or accomplish in the
presence of two witnesses. Aside from the standard sizes, Apple Pages allow users to
select from other paper sizes, including the tabloid size with measurements of 11 x 17
inches, folio size measuring 8.5 x 13 inches, executive size of 7.25 x 10.5 inches, and A3
with measurements of 11.69 x 16.54 inches.



Last Will and Testament Sizes for Google Docs

Google Docs is a user-friendly word processor that an individual can use by logging into
their Google Account. It has a set quantity of paper sizes that individuals can choose from,
including the standard sizes of US Letter size and A4 size, but aside from these, there are
also the tabloid, folio, legal, A5, A3, B4, etc. And the best thing about Google Docs is that it
automatically saves the progress as the user writes the content.



Last Will and Testament Sizes FAQs

What is the font size of a last will and testament?

The font size for last will and testament documents follows the 12-point font size that
lawyers and courts use for legal documents.

What is a good size for a last will and testament?

Last will and testaments are legal documents that must have the standard sizes of either
the US Letter size of 8.5 x 11 inches or A4 of 8.3 x 11.7 inches.

How many pages should a last will and testament be?

The last will and testament document must be between the average four to five pages.

What are the legal requirements of a last will and testament?

Constructing a last will and testament document requires a testator to write the document in
a language or dialect that a testator knows and understands with at least three witnesses
with signatures coming from the witnesses and testator on all the pages of the document.

What is the structure of a last will and testament?

The structure of the last will and testament includes title, declaration, executor and guardian
identification, beneficiaries, assets, bequests, funeral arrangements, and signatures.

What font is used for a last will and testament?

Last will and testament documents are legal documents with fonts that relay the
seriousness of the contents by using Garamond, Georgia, Times New Roman, Arial, or
Calibri.



What is the last will and testament format?

The last will and testament format must contain essential components like the testator,
executors, bequests, beneficiaries, the residuary estate, foreign assets, children, and
guardians.

How to reduce the size of the last will and testament?

To reduce the document size of a last will and testament, the individual writing the
document must only incorporate necessary information and remove unnecessary elements
like charts or clipart images.

What are the last will and testament sizes?

The standardized paper sizes for last will and testament documents include the US Letter
size (8.5 x 11 inches), Legal (8.5 x 14 inches), and A4 (8.3 x 11.7 inches).

How do you change the size of the last will and testament?

To change the size of last will and testament documents, open the word document in a word
processor program like Microsoft Word, Apple Pages, or Google Docs and change the page
set up for the paper size selecting from US Letter, A4, Legal, tabloid, folio, etc.

What do you write on the last will and testament?

Last will and testament documents start with identifying the testator, including their full name
and address, assigning an executor and guardian, identifying beneficiaries, indicating
funeral arrangements, and affixing signatures.

How long is the last will and testament valid?

There are no expiration dates when writing the last will and testament, retaining its validity
for years.



What are the dimensions of the last will and testament?

The dimensions of last will and testament documents are in US Letter size of 8.5 x 11
inches, Legal of 8.5 x 14 inches, or A4 of 8.3 inches x 11.7 inches.

What is a last will and testament in estate planning?

Testators create last will and testament documents to prepare and plan for the legal
distribution of estates to beneficiaries.

How do I make a last will and testament at home?

A testator can create the last will and testament at home by having witnesses sign the
document with them after they complete the will.


